From: Todd Croteau tcroteau@townofjaffrey.com
Subject: RE: Bid

Date: August 25, 2021 at 9:03 AM
To: R Stephenson 5327653@gmail.com, Michael Petrovick mpetrovick@mijparchitect.com
Cc: rob@rs41.org, Jon Frederick jfrederick@townofjaffrey.com

Good morning all,

| had a conversation with Bradley Davis. He states that he is available on September 7th

3pm to review scope and schedule.

at 2pm or

Kind regards,
Todd

Todd J. Croteau

Superintendent of Highways and Facilities
23 Knight Street

Jaffrey, NH 03452

603-532-6521

From: R Stephenson <5327653@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, August 23, 2021 5:19 PM

To: Michael Petrovick <mpetrovick@mjparchitect.com>

Cc: rob@rs41.org; Jon Frederick <jfrederick@townofjaffrey.com>; Todd Croteau
<tcroteau@townofjaffrey.com>

Subject: Bid

Hi Michael,

| met with Jon Frederick and Todd Croteau today and Todd will contact Brad and see about a
meeting to talk about the project.

The dates mentioned were

Friday 3 September in the AM
Tuesday 7 September. Anytime

Do either of these work for you?

Question: LCHIP pays half of the project cost. Will they pay 1/2 of the contract price ($159,850) or
only 1/2 of our estimated cost ($137,000)?

Also, does LCHIP have to review/approve the contract?

Regards,

Rnh



PS: my rob@rs41 email is acting up, hence gmail.

Robert Stephenson
5327653 @gmail.com
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